

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT

REGION: I **CALENDAR YEAR:** 2025
PROVINCE: Pangasinan **QUARTER:** 1
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: Calasiao

| No. | Reference No. | Name of Project | Approved Budget for Contract | Location | Winning Bidder | Name and Address | Bid Amount | Bidding Date | Contract Duration |
|-----|---------------|--|------------------------------|--------------------------------|---|--|--------------|-------------------|-------------------|
| 1 | 11553455 | Rehabilitation of Calasiao Sports Complex | 5,000,000.00 | Pob. West Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta. barbar Pangasinan | 4,999,500.00 | December 23, 2024 | 60CD |
| 2 | 11553551 | Rehabilitation of Multi- Purpose Building Covered Court at Bued Elementary School | 4,000,000.00 | Bued Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta. barbar Pangasinan | 3,999,500.00 | December 23, 2024 | 45CD |
| 3 | 11553603 | Construction of Elevated Water Tank/ Installation of GoatLine/ Site Development at Newly Constructed Slaughter House | 3,228,380.58 | Mancup, Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta. barbar Pangasinan | 3,228,000.00 | December 23, 2024 | 40CD |
| 4 | 11553780 | Concreting of Road at Barangay Cabilooaan | 1,500,000.00 | Cabilooaan Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta. barbar Pangasinan | 1,499,500.00 | December 23, 2024 | 25CD |
| 5 | 11643405 | Concreting of Road at Barangay Ambuetel (Sitio Laguinlin, Garcia, Saplan & Sagur) | 3,000,000.00 | Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta. barbar Pangasinan | 2,999,500.00 | January 27, 2025 | 35CD |
| 6 | 11669985 | Construction of Multi- Purpose Hall at Malabago Elementary School | 2,600,000.00 | Malabago, Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta. barbar Pangasinan | 2,599,500.00 | February 10, 2025 | 28CD |
| 7 | 11670061 | Repair and Maintenance of Classroom at Bued East Elementary School | 250,000.00 | Bued, Calasiao Pangasinan | Mañalac Construction and Supply | Melchor D. Mañalac Bued Calasiao Pangasinan | 249,501.25 | January 27, 2025 | 7CD |
| 8 | 11670071 | Rehabilitation/ Improvement of Faculty Office at CCNHS | 300,000.00 | Calasiao Pangasinan | Mañalac Construction and Supply | Melchor D. Mañalac Bued Calasiao Pangasinan | 299,499.81 | January 27, 2025 | 10CD |
| 9 | 11670077 | Rehabilitation/ Improvement of School Facilities at Buenlag E/S | 555,000.00 | Buenlag, Calasiao Pangasinan | Mañalac Construction and Supply | Melchor D. Mañalac Bued Calasiao Pangasinan | 554,459.15 | January 27, 2025 | 18CD |

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT

REGION: I **CALENDAR YEAR:** 2025
PROVINCE: Pangasinan **QUARTER:** 1
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: Calasiao

| No. | Reference No. | Name of Project | Approved Budget for Contract | Location | Winning Bidder | Name and Address | Bid Amount | Bidding Date | Contract Duration |
|-----|---------------|--|------------------------------|---------------------------------|---|--|-------------|-------------------|-------------------|
| 10 | 11687024 | Concstruction of Perimeter Fence at Doña Maria Subdivision Buenlag Calasiao Pangasinan(Phase II) | 995, 000.00 | Buenlag, Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta.barbar Pangasinan | 994, 500.00 | February 3, 2025 | 24CD |
| 11 | 11687058 | Dredging/ Cleaning and Declogging of Rivers and Estuaries | 700, 000.00 | Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta.barbar Pangasinan | 699, 500.00 | February 3, 2025 | 8CD |
| 12 | 11687071 | Repair/ Riprap of Eroded Roads at Various Barangays | 700, 000.00 | Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta.barbar Pangasinan | 699, 500.00 | February 3, 2025 | 20CD |
| 13 | 11687087 | Repair/ Rehabilitation of Damaged Infra Facilities | 995, 000.00 | Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta.barbar Pangasinan | 994, 500.00 | February 3, 2025 | 24CD |
| 14 | 11719039 | Rehabilitation/ Improvement of Calasiao Public Market (Roofing) | 950, 000.00 | Pob. West Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta.barbar Pangasinan | 949, 500.00 | February 12, 2025 | 28CD |
| 15 | 11719131 | Installation and Purchase of Heavy Duty Generator Set for Newly Constructed Slaughter House | 800, 000.00 | Mancup Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta.barbar Pangasinan | 799, 500.00 | February 12, 2025 | 15CD |
| 16 | 11757611 | Construction of Multi- Purpose Shed (for solid waste management equipment) at CCNHS | 425, 000.00 | Pob. West Calasiao Pangasinan | Mañalac Construction and Supply | Melchor D. Mañalac Bued Calasiao Pangasinan | 424, 504.27 | February 21, 2025 | 14CD |
| 17 | 11757627 | Repair/ Improvement of MSWD Office | 400, 000.00 | Pob. East Calasiao Pangasinan | Mañalac Construction and Supply | Melchor D. Mañalac Bued Calasiao Pangasinan | 399, 500.00 | February 21, 2025 | 14CD |
| 18 | 11804008 | Concreting of road at Brgy San Vicente (Interior Sitio Road) | 995, 000.00 | San Vicente Calasiao Pangasinan | Mañalac Construction and Supply | Melchor D. Mañalac Bued Calasiao Pangasinan | 994, 500.00 | March 5, 2025 | 21 CD |

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT

REGION: I CALENDAR YEAR: 2025
PROVINCE: Pangasinan QUARTER: 1
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: Calasiao

| No. | Reference No. | Name of Project | Approved Budget for Contract | Location | Winning Bidder | Name and Address | Bid Amount | Bidding Date | Contract Duration |
|-----|---------------|---|------------------------------|------------------------------|---|--|-------------|---------------|-------------------|
| 19 | 11804129 | Construction of Road at Brgy. Buenlag (Barongan Street and Little Tondo Street) | 995, 000.00 | Buenlag, Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta.barbar Pangasinan | 994, 500.00 | March 5, 2025 | 21 CD |
| 20 | 11804255 | Concreting of Road at Sitio Baybay Brgy. Quesban | 995, 000.00 | Quesban Calasiao Pangasinan | Jeusmack Builders & Construction Supply | Jeselette DG. Desamero Pob. Norte, Sta.barbar Pangasinan | 994, 500.00 | March 5, 2025 | 21 CD |
| | | | | | | | | | |

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

MA. VICTORIA P. DEL ROSARIO
BAC Secretariat Head

ENGR. EDWIN P. TIGNO
BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: I CALENDAR YEAR: 2025
 PROVINCE: PANGASINAN 1
 CITY/MUNICIPALITY: CALASIAO

| REFERENCE NO. | Item Description | Approved Budget for Contract | Winning Bidder | Name and Address Of Bidder | Bid Amount | Date of Bidding |
|---------------|---|------------------------------|-------------------------|---|--------------|-------------------|
| 11667489 | Purchase of Various Medicines for Municipal Health Office | 1,499,919.68 | Rhenamae's Trading | Jammaica Ann U. Resultay Pob. Basista Pangasinan | 1,499,600.11 | February 10, 2025 |
| 11692609 | Purchase of Canned Goods for StockPiling | 900, 000.00 | KCJ General Merchandise | Maria Alicia P. Guba Gabon Calasiao Pangasinan | 898, 350.00 | February 5, 2025 |
| 11696341 | Purchase of Rice for StockPiling | 900, 000.00 | KCJ General Merchandise | Maria Alicia P. Guba Gabon Calasiao Pangasinan | 899, 280.00 | February 5, 2025 |
| 11703892 | Purchase of Vaccine for Animal Bite Center | 375, 000.00 | Gulf Med Enterprises | Alma A. Dela Calzada Dagupan City | 372, 300.00 | February 7, 2025 |
| | | | | | | |

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

MA. VICTORIA P. DEL ROSARIO
 BAC Secretariat Head

ENGR. EDWIN P. TIGNO
 BAC Chairperson

FDP Form 10c - Bid Results on Consulting Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

CONSULTING SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: I **CALENDAR YEAR:** 2025
PROVINCE: PANGASINAN **QUARTER:** 1
CITY/MUNICIPALITY: CALASIAO

| No. | Reference No. | Name of Project | Location | Approved Budget for Contract | Winning Bidder | Name and Address | Bid Amount | Bidding Date | Contract Duration |
|-----|---------------|-----------------|-------------------|------------------------------|----------------|------------------|------------|--------------|-------------------|
| | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | NO BIDDING | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | | |

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

MA. VICTORIA P. DEL ROSARIO
 BAC Secretariat Head

ENGR. EDWIN P. TIGNO
 BAC Chairperson